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NIACL Assistant Total Vacancies : 685

Event Dates

Online registration started 16/07/2018

Online Registration Closed 31/07/2018

Tier I exam date 8th or 9th September 2018  (tentatively)

Tier II exam date 6th October 2018  (tentatively)

NIACL Assistant Eligibility: 

Age Eligibility (as on 30/06/2018): 21 years to 30 years of age

Qualification (As on the date of application registration): Graduation 

NIACL Assistant Application Fee:

General / OBC Rs. 500/-

SC/ ST/ PWD/ Ex. S/ Females Rs. 50/- 

NIACL  Assistant Selection Process:

1. Prelims Exam, 2. Mains Exam, 3. LPT (Language Proficiency Test) 

NIACL  Assistant Prelims Exam Pattern (Phase I):

Sr. No. Name of Tests No. of  Maximum Total Time
  Questions Marks

1. English Language 30 30 

2. Numerical Ability 35 35

3. Reasoning Ability 35 35

 Total 100 100

NIACL Assistant Mains Exam Pattern (Phase II)

Sr. No. Name of Tests No. of  Maximum Total Time
  Questions Marks

1. Reasoning Ability 40 50

2. English Language 40 50

3. Numerical Ability 40 50

4. General Awareness 40 50

5. Computer Knowledge 40 50

 Total 200 250

RBI Grade B Total Number of Vacancies: 166

 General DEPR DSIM Total

 127 22 17 166

Event Date

A release of Application Form 03/07/2018

Last Date of Registration Process & Fee Payment 23/07/2018

Online Exam Date Phase I 16/08/2018

Online Exam Date Phase II 07/09/2018

RBI Grade B Eligibility Criteria:

(a) Age (as on 01-07-2018): Between 21 and 30 years (both ages include). 
The candidates possessing M.Phil. and Ph.D. qualification, upper age limit 
will be 32 and 34 years respectively.

(b) Educational Qualifications: 

Posts Min. Edu. Qualification (as on 01-07-2018):

1. Officer in Grade Bachelor’s degree {(minimum of 60% marks (50% 

 ‘B’ (DR) (General) in case of SC/ST/PWD)}

2. Officers in  Essential:A Master’s Degree in Economics with a

Grade ‘B’ (DR) minimum of 55% marks (50% in case of SC/ST/PWD) 

DEPR Desirable : A Doctorate Degree in Economics 

1. Exam Pattern of RBI Grade B (DR) Prelims (Phase I):

Sr. No. Name of Tests No. of  Maximum Total Time
  Questions Marks

1. English Language 30 30

2. Numerical Ability 30 30

3. Reasoning Ability 60 60

4. General Awareness 80 80

 Total 200 200

2. Exam Pattern of RBI Grade B (DR) Mains (Phase II) : 

Sr. No. Name of Tests Paper Type Max. Duration
   Marks

1. Economics and Social Objective 100 90 min.
 Issues

2. Paper II English  Descriptive  100 90 min.
 (Writing Skills) 

3. Paper III Finance &  Objective Type 100 90 min. 

 Management

Composite

time of 

1 hour

Composite

time of 

120 Minutes

Composite

time of 

120 Minutes



MONTHLY UPDATE

NATIONAL NEWS

v Union Cabinet has approved an ordinance to set up country's 

1st national sports university in __________.  Manipur

v ASEAN Film Festival will be hosted by ______ New Delhi 

v PM Modi inaugurated India's 1st 14-lane highway. This 

highway connects ________ Delhi-Meerut

v Bangladesh Bhawan is located at __________, West 

Bengal.  Santiniketan 

v PM Modi laid foundation stone of Patratu Super Thermal 

Power Project. In which state this project is located    

 Jharkhand

v 9th edition of Rashtriya Sanskriti Mahotsav has been 

inaugurated in __________.  Uttarakhand 

v _____become the first state in the Northeast to have solar 

toilets Manipur

v _____India's 1st highway which is lit by solar power.  

 Eastern Peripheral Expressway 

v _______ is India's most decorated army general  

 Zorawar Chand Bakshi

v The main event of 4th International Yoga Day celebrations 

(IDY-2018) will be held on 21st June 2018 at __________.  

 Dehradun 

v ________ government has introduced 'Prakritik Kheti 

Khushhaal Kisaan Yojana' to raise agricultural income by 

adopting low-cost climate-resilient Zero Budget Natural 

Farming System (ZBNF) Himachal Pradesh

v Patanjali has tied up with __________ Telecom Company 

by launching 'Swadeshi Samriddhi' SIM cards.   BSNL

v _____is the rank of India in terms of wind energy 

installation capacity at around 33GW 4th 

v ____________country's prime minister launched 'Clean Air 

India Initiative' in Delhi Netherlands

v ________bollywood actress launched Gaj Yatra in Garo 

Hills to raise awareness about shrinking space for wild 

elephants in the country Dia Mirza 

INTERNATIONAL NEWS

v _______the 1st South-East Asian country to eliminate 

Trachoma Nepal 

v India will attend the Shanghai Corporation Organization-

Regional Anti-Terrorist Structure legal experts meeting 

which will be held in __________.   India

v 2018 Organization for Economic Co-operation and 

Development (OECD) meet will be held in ______. Paris

v 1st edition of Global Wind Summit will be held in 

_________  Hamburg

v Microsoft has become __________ most valuable firm 

globally after Apple and Amazon. Third 

v _______is the theme of International Day of United Nations 

Peacekeepers 2018  70 Years of Service and Sacrifice

v _______international airport has been recognized as world's 

1st fully solar energy-powered airport 

  Cochin International Airport

v Prime Minister Narendra Modi launched International 

Rupay Card, Bhim App and UPI in _______ Singapore

v India has signed the Mutual Recognition Agreement (MRA) 

in Nursing with________ Singapore

v Prime Minister NarendraModi recently gave the Padma Shri 

award to Tommy Koh who belongs to __________.    

 Singapore 

v Cuba and the United States have agreed to permanently 

restore direct postal service between the two countries 

which had been suspended for decades. The direct postal 

service between two neighboring nations was suspended by 

__________.    Havana 

BANKING & ECONOMY

v ______ bank has launched digital loans against mutual 

funds in partnership with transfer agent CAMS HDFC 

v Paytm Payments Bank has launched Paytm AshaKiran to 

educate rural women with partnership of __________.   

 UNDP

v India signs a loan agreement with which bank for Rajasthan 

Project World Bank

v __________amount provided by  World Bank approved for 

Atal Bhujal Yojana to recharge and maintain groundwater 

level in some areas which are facing a severe water crisis in 

coming years 6000

v HDFC bank will charge __________ for one month as well 

as overnight loans.  8.05%

v State Bank of India recorded its highest non-performing 

asset (NPAs) of __________  crore in 2017-18.    

 Rs. 1.1 lakh crore

v ___________banks has commanded the largest value share 

of mobile banking transactions Axis Bank

v YES Bank shareholders have approved re-appointment of 

__________ as chief executive officer and managing 

director of bank for three years.  Rana Kapoor

v World Bank has approved $700 million to help __________ 

attain its education for all vision by improving primary 

education sector.  Bangladesh 

v 4th regional conference of Asian Infrastructure Investment 

Bank (AIIB) was organized in _______.  Bengaluru

v _________ millions did India signed loan deal with World 

Bank for National Nutrition Mission 200

PERSONS IN NEWS

v ________ is the first Indian to receive Linnean Medal in 

Botany Dr. Kamaljt Bawa 

v Sunil Chhetri achieved __________ to win Intercontinental 

Cup 64 

v 19-year-old _______was named Miss India at 55th Femina 

Miss India 2018 by Miss World 2017 Manushi Chhillar in 

Mumbai  Anukreethy Vas

v ________ is  1st woman lawyer appointed as SC judge in 

india  Indu Malhotra

v _______ has been conferred with annual Women Economic 

Forum (WEF) 2018 Nisha Bhalla

v _________ has resigned as Chief Minister of Karnataka, 

failing to prove majority in Karnataka Assembly   

 BS Yeddyurappa

v ______ the India's youngest-ever gold medallist at the 

Commonwealth Games (CWG) Anish Bhanwala

v ________ has become the first Indian to win two singles 

gold in Commonwealth Games Saina Nehwal

v ________ has become the first Indian woman wrestler to 

win gold in the Senior Asian Championship. Navjot Kaur

v __________has created history by becoming the first ever 

Dalit Hindu woman to get elected as Senator in Pakistan.   

 Krishna Kumar Kohli

NEW APPOINTMENT

v ____________ has been appointed as the prime minister of 

Lebanon for third time Saad Hariri 

v Sudha Balkrishnan has been appointed as Chief Financial 

Officer (CFO) of which of the following banks_______  

 Reserve Bank of India

v ______has been appointed as the president of National 

Consumer Disputes Redressal Commission   RK Agrawal 

v Giuseppe Conte has sworn in as prime minister of 

__________.  Italy  

v _______has been appointed as acting chief of Union Public 

Service Commission Arvind Saxena

v _______ has been appointed as non-executive chairman of 

Bandhan Bank H R Khan

v _________has been appointed as secretory of Ministry of 

Coal Dr. InderJit Singh

OBITUARIES
v Narayan Prasad, popularly known as 'Rasaraj', has passed 

away recently. He earned his name in __________.    
 Odia music 

v ________senior journalist and writer died at the age of 79 
 Adiraju Venkateswara Rao

v Tony Daniel who passed away recently is associated with 
________ Athletics

v Arun Date, who recently passed away, was a famous 
__________.  Singer

v Renowned lyricist Gurukrushna Goswami recently passed 
away. He was related with __________ music industry.   
 Odia

v Nirmal Hirawat passed away recently. He is the former 
minister ________  Madhya Pradesh 

v Rajinder Pal who died recently was a renowned player of 
__________.  Cricket

v Renowned Hindi film lyricist __________ passed away. He 
was a Lok Sabha member between 1984 and 1989 and 
former Rajya Sabha MP.  Nandram Das Bairagi

v E.C.G. Sudarshan has passed away recently. He was 
__________.  Physicist 

v Yaddanapudi Sulochana Rani who hailed from Kaza village 
of Krishna district has recently passed away. She was a 
renowned __________.  Novelist 

v CV Rajinderan passed away recently. He was a famous : 
 Movie Director

v RK Dorendra passes away. He is the former CM of 
__________ Manipur

v Recently popular actor Kolam Ajith passed away. He 
worked for _____  Malayalam cinema

AWARDS

v ______ Indian Cricketer has been awarded as 'Most 
Inspiring Icon of the Year for Social Welfare' Yuvraj Singh 

v _______won International Cricketer of the Year at CEAT 
Cricket Rating Awards Virat Kohli

v ______ the Indian Cartoonist who won International Award 
in best caricature category. Thomas Antony

v _________received Santokbaa Humanitarian Award 
 Kailash Satyarathi 

v ______win Pulitzer Prize in Music for his 2017 album 
"DAMN" Kendrick Lamar

v ________has won the ONV Literary Prize for contribution 
to Malayalam Literature MT Vasudevan Nair

v ________ is the recipient of 1st Nobel Peace Prize  
 Henry Dunant

v __________Conferred KISS Humanitarian Award 2018  
 Muhammad Yunus

v __________ has been honoured with the Swara Mauli 
award Lata Mangeshkar

v _________has been awarded with 23rd Nikkei Asia Prize 
 Dr. Bindeshwar Pathak 
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MONTHLY UPDATE
IMPORTANT DAYS

v International Day of United Nations Peacekeeper is 
observed worldwide on __________.   May 29

v World Day against Child Labour is observed globally on 
__________.  June 12

v India's 1st ever national police museum will be inaugurated 
on __________.   October 21 

v Green Mizoram Day was observed on __________ across 
Mizoram state.  June 11

v World Honey Bee Day is celebrated on __________.    
 August 18

v World Blood Donor Day is observed on __________.  
 June 14

v International Day for the Elimination of Sexual Violence in 
Conflict is observed on __________.   June 19

v World Refugee Day is observed on __________ every year 
by united nations.  June 20

v World Music Day is observed every year on __________. 
 June 21

v International Widows' Day takes place annually on 
____________.   June 23 

v World Intellectual Property Day is observed on 26 April

v The World Immunization Week is observed from 
__________ 24 April to 30 April

BOOKS & AUTHOR’S
v Former PM Manmohan Singh released a book titled "My 

Journey from Marxism-Leninism to Nehruvian Socialism". 
This book is authored by ______. CH Hanumantha Rao

v _______book was Release By Chief Of Army Staff    
Across the Bench - Insight into the Indian Military Judicial 
 System'

v Twilights Children' is a book on _______. Down Syndrom

v "A Tribute to Jagu" book has been depicted on the life of: 
 Jagmohan Dalmiya

v The book "Paramveer Parwane" has been released by: 
 Indian Army

v "The Tall Man" book has been written on the life of: 
 Biju Patnaik

v Writer Shesh Anand Madhukar has been honoured with 
Sahitya Akademi Bhasha Samman award. He writes in 
______ language. Magahi

v The book "Exam Warrior" written by __________. 
 Narendra Modi

v 'A Century is not Enough' is the Autobiography of: 
 SouravGanguly

v Who authored the book "Hari Singh Nalwa: Champion of 
the Khalsaji - 1791-1837"? Vanit Nalwa

SPORTS
v _______team defeated Sun Risers Hyderabad to clinch their 

third Indian Premier League title Chennai Super Kings

v ____________ became 1st Indian Cricketer to score 200 
scores in T20 Internationals?   Mithali Raj 

v ______has beat Kenya to win Intercontinental Football Cup 
2018 India 

v Indian Women's Hockey team lost in opening match of five-
match series against ______ Spain

v _________won "Sportsperson of the Year award "by the 
Sports Illustrated India magazine  Kidambi Srikanth

v _________ won South Asian U-12 Tennis Championship 
 India

v _______ won maiden title on Tennis Challenger Circuit 
 Prajnesh Gunneswaran

SCIENCE & TECHNOLOGY

v India and United States had signed a Memorandum of 
Understanding (MoU) in __________ to have scientific and 
technical cooperation in Earth observations and Earth 
sciences. 2008

v A new communication satellite 'APSTAR-6C' has been 
launched by __________.  China

v A hyper spectral imaging satellite called "Goafen-5" has 
been launched to monitor air pollution by __________. 
 China

v __________ Launches Most Powerful Falcon 9 Rocket  
 SpaceX

v Name of satellite launched by GSLV is.  GSAT-6A

v India's Department of Space (DoS) have signed cooperation 
agreement related to sharing of earth observation satellite 
data with :  European Union (EU)

v _______ have developed artificial heart using rocket 
technology and it is currently undergoing thorough testing 
experiments on animals : China

v Indian Space Research Organisation (ISRO) has signed 
Technology Transfer Agreement (TTA) with Bharat Heavy 
Electricals Limited (BHEL) for manufacturing Space Grade 
________ Ion cells.  Lithium

DEFENCE & SECURITY
v _________ is the name of World's largest international 

maritime exercise RIMPAC

v ______ many countries will participate in biennial Rim of 
the Pacific (RIMPAC) military exercise from June 27 to 
August 2 around Hawaiian Islands and Southern California 
 26

v Indian Minister inaugurated 1st biannual Indian Air Force 
Commanders' Conference at Air Headquarters in New Delhi 
 Nirmala Sitharaman 

v 22nd edition of exercise Malabar has been conducted at 
__________.  Guam 

v ________ will host the first military exercise of BIMSTEC 
(Bay of Bengal Initiative for Multi-Sectoral Technical and 
Economic Cooperation) group focusing on counter-
terrorism  India

PRACTICE QUESTIONS OF QUANTITATIVE APTITUDE
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RULES OF CONJUNCTION 
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www. makemyexam.in

Rule 1 :  ‘Not only …..but also , Either …..or , Neither …..nor ’these are 
co-relative conjunctions or termed as co-relatives . Its special 
features are to join two subjects or two objects or two verbs.

   Example : 

   •  Not only Deepak and also Moti can do it (Incorrect)

   •  Not only Ram but also sham has done his work. (Correct)

Rule 2 : Both must be followed by and not ‘as well as’ or ‘else’. So in exams 
be aware of this facts.

   Example :   

   • Both Ram as well as Shyam may come today (Incorrect)

   • Both Ram and Shyam may come today (Correct)

Rule 3 : Whether must be followed by ‘or’. Most of the time in exams they 
use ‘that’ or ‘if’ in place of ‘or’ . so be aware of this facts

   Example :  

   • I don’t know that he will come or not (Incorrect)

   • I don’t know whether he will come or not (Correct)

ASSAM
Bongaigaon  : +91-88766-43950 

Jorhat : +91-80117-42063

Tinsukia : +91-81350-55680

Tezpur : +91-97079-28084

BIHAR
Chapra : +91-90066-45948

Hazipur : +91-86601-76105

Nawada : +91-94725-97113

CHANDIGARH
Sec-34 A : +91-86998-86998

DELHI
Jungpura : +91-98739-99470 

Laxmi Nagar (Co) : +91-93327-93327

GUJARAT
Ahmedabad : +91-96244-46611

Navsari : +91-75749-08023

Nizampura : +91-90333-18450

Vadodara (OP Road) : +91-99044-05343

HARYANA
Ambala : +91-70822-69082

Karnal : +91-87081-66685

Yamunanagar : +91-74049-09400

HIMACHAL PRADESH
Hamirpur : +91-98051-51212

Mandi : +91-98167-59903

JHARKHAND
Ranchi : +91-75418-90365

Jamshedpur : +91-89696-93181

KARNATAKA
Bellari : +91-94480-06123

Haveri : +91-94816-84458

Jamkhandi : +91-70221-89290

Udupi : +91-0820-2535156

KERALA
Kottayam : +91-90722-74008

Malapuram : +91-90370-07555

Pala : +91-85475-93969

Payyanur : +91-90723-76007

MADHYA PRADESH
Dewas : +91-80850-65253

Indore : +91-97703-21000

Mhow (Indore) : +91-75095-19727

Ujjan : +91-97703-21000

MAHARASHTRA
Amaravati : +91-70574-72303

Ahmednagar : +91-98223-33888

Baramati : +91-73505-40768

Dombivili : +91-84240-42250

Hadapsar : +91-96072-13171

Nagpur (ZO) : +91-99670-29818

Nanded : +91-72180-09992

Nashik : +91-7030677776

Pune-Baner Road : +91-84118-41272

Pune-Pimple Saudagar : +91-95118-12253

Satara : +91-92269-84852

Wardha New : +91-98223-60985 

ORISSA
Balasore : +91-99372-02649

Cuttack : +91-77880-74377

PUNJAB
Amritsar : +91-98887-10660

Barnala : +91-82830-89447

Bathinda : +91-98154-15447

Ferozepur : +91-97813-53043

Hoshiarpur : +91-86995-86999

Jalandhar : +91-94636-12090

Kapurthala : +91-98157-87319

Ludhiana : +91-92163-80013

Moga : +91-92757-00004

Pathankot : +91-90418-76534

Patiala : +91-84372-06665

Sangrur : +91-98559-26805

RAJASTHAN
Ajmer : +91-92523-75222

Alwar : +91-79734-01329

Bhiwadi : +91-98129-76274

TAMIL NADU
Chennai (Adambakkam) : +91-90430-43132

Chennai (Ambattur) : +91-96772-04875

Chennai (Anna Nagar) : +91-82200-20021

Chennai (Arcot) : +91-73736-78111 

Coimbatore : +91-98422-97768

Dharmapuri : +91-98428-60105

Gobichettipalayam : +91-98422-73499     

Guduvacherry : +91-98840-00251

Hosur : +91-94433-89244 

Kallakurichi : +91-97872-62658

Kancheepuram : +91-98849-21439

Karaikudi : +91-97502-49489

Karur : +91-94861-11498

Kothagiri : +91-94882-73377

Kumbakonam : +91-93645-59397

Madurai : +91-97878-88228

Mayiladuthurai : +91-89734-05050

MDU-Simmakkal : +91-97916-55886

Mettupalayam : +91-98654-55652 

Pallavaram, Chennai : +91-93812-30977

Perambur : +91-97909-23092

Perungudi : +91-95141-14455

Pudukkottai : +91-74485-65828

Purasaiwalkam : +91-98411-18881

Porur : +91-93829-13366

Chennai (Tambaram) : +91-99400-34201

Thanjavur : +91-99413-33487

Tirupattur-Nasa : +91-98428-22352

Thiruninravur : +91-98402-12402 

Tuticorin : 0461-2330137

Vaniyambadi : +91-94437-47970

Vellore (Sathuvachari) : +91-88704-72431

Villupuram : +91-93834-45556

Old Washermanpet : +91-94445-16571

TELANGANA
Dilsukhnagar : +91-81850-04422

Habsiguda : +91-91777-30001

Warangal : +91-85008-98970

UTTAR PRADESH
Allahabad : +91-81729-69180

Moradabad : +91-98377-80072

Saharanpur : +91-97597-23315

Sultanpur : +91-73480-87979

Varanasi : +91-97951-52374

UTTARAKHAND
Kashipur : +91-75008-28111

Dehradun : +91-74889-12591

WEST BENGAL 
Bankura : +91-97332-20909

Howrah : +91-98360-7759

Kolkata : +91-90884-79999

Malda : +91-98324-06455

Siliguri : +91-74300-28870

Rule 4 : After ‘Although’ or ‘Though’ Yet comes at the end. But in exams 
they use but , or , else , and etc. , so be aware in such cases. You can 
also use comma in place of Yet to make the sentence correct.

   Example : 

    • Although he is rich but/and he is dishonest (Incorrect)

   • Although he is rich , he is dishonest (Correct)

Rule 5 : ‘So….as / As…..as’ is used in Positive degree to compare between 
two persons or two things.

   So…..as is used in Negative sentence

   As…..as is used in both Positive and Negative sentence

   Examples :

   •  Ram is not so good as you (Negative Sentence)

   •  Ram is as good as you (Afrmative sentence)

   •  Ram is not as good as you (Negative sentence)
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